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Alerts

1 event
14 results matching for 'Corrigenda' during October 2010.

Number Title Date
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2006276675 Sleep disorder treating device and sleep disorder treating method 06 Oct 2010

2010200970 Energy-dissipating element and shock absorber comprising an energy-dissipating element 06 Oct 2010

2010100007 Duplicate_Barcode 06 Oct 2010

2004206971 Method of treatment of conditions by administration of streptolysin o 06 Oct 2010

2010902097 Mineral compositons 06 Oct 2010

2004203058 A boat with perimeter float, particularly a pneumatic life raft 06 Oct 2010

2005247016 Pulse torque generator and power tool having the same 06 Oct 2010

2010902085 Lazydays Beach Hammock 06 Oct 2010

2004289229 Stimulation of hair growth by Ginkgo biloba flavanoids 06 Oct 2010

2007203426 Methods for treating neuropsychiatric disorders with NMDA receptor antagonists 06 Oct 2010

2009221969 Process for preparing benzothiazepines from gamma-aminoalkylbenzenes 06 Oct 2010

2010214807 Particulate composition containing anhydrous crystalline 2-O-a-D-glucosyl-L-ascorbic
acid, process for producing the same and uses thereof

06 Oct 2010

2005316202 An adapter for a magnetic clamp 06 Oct 2010

2009242144 Diffuser for shaving foam spray 06 Oct 2010
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Terms and Conditions
General

The information provided in this report is not in the nature of legal or other professional advice.

The information provided in this report is derived from third parties and may contain errors. You must
make your own enquiries and seek independent advice from the relevant industry professionals
regarding any information in this report.

Patents, patent applications, trademarks and trademark applications shown as lapsed or ceased may be
restored at a later date.

Disclaimer of warranty and limitation of liability

Neither IPMonitor, its affiliates nor any of their respective employees, agents, third party content
providers or licensors warrant that the information contained in this report is error free; nor do they
make any warranty as to the accuracy, reliability or content of any information in this report.

This report is provided on an "as is" basis; to the maximum extent permitted by law, IPMonitor
disclaims all representations and warranties, express or implied, with respect to any information
conatined in this report. In addition, IPMonitor does not represent or warrant that the information
contained in this report is accurate, complete or current.

This disclaimer of liability applies to any damages or injury caused by any failure of performance,
error, omission, interruption, deletion, defect, delay in operation or transmission, computer virus,
communication line failure, theft or destruction or unauthorized access to, alteration of, or use of
record, whether for breach of contract, tortious behavior, negligence, or under any other cause of
action.

Copyright

The content of this report may be protected by copyright laws and treaties around the world and all
rights relating to the same are reserved. Any paper or digital copies of this report are not to be
modified or any illustrations or any graphics used separately from any accompanying text.

Arbitration

Any dispute or difference whatsoever arising out of or in connection with this report shall be
submitted to arbitration in accordance with, and subject to, The Institute of Arbitrators & Mediators
Australia Rules for the Conduct of Commercial Arbitrations.

IPMonitor reserves the right to update the Terms and Conditions at any time without notice. Please
see the full Terms and Conditions at www.IPMonitor.com.au/trademarks/info/terms
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